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PENDING LEGISLATION 
December 2, 2024 

 
Temp. No. Introduced Committee Description        
A-105 10/28/24 Fin An ordinance establishing annual 

appropriations of money for the 
current expenses, capital 
expenditures, and other expenses 
of the City of Cuyahoga Falls for 
the fiscal year ending December 
31, 2025, and declaring an 
emergency. 

 
A-116 11/25/24 Fin An ordinance authorizing the 

Director of Law to enter into a 
contract or contracts, without 
competitive bidding, with 
Benesch, Friedlander, Coplan, & 
Aronoff LLP for legal services 
related to employment matters 
and collective bargaining; 
increasing appropriations in the 
general fund law department, and 
declaring an emergency. 

 
A-117 11/25/24 Fin An ordinance authorizing the 

Director of Public Service to enter 
into a contract or contracts, 
without competitive bidding, with 
Schweitzer Engineering 
Laboratories for the purchase of 
automation controllers, advance 
recloser controls, and cellular 
routers for use in the Electric 
Department   and declaring an 
emergency. 

 
A-106 10/28/24 CD An ordinance authorizing the 

Mayor to enter into a license 

agreement with the Brook 
Heights Community Association, 
LLC, for the purpose of 
constructing and maintaining 
monument signs in a portion of 
the city right-of-way and 
declaring an emergency. 
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Committee Meeting Schedule 

December 2, 2024 

  

Planning & Zoning Subject to Call 

Finance  6:30 

Public Improvements Subject to Call 

Public Affairs Subject to Call 

Community Development Subject to Call 

Sustainability, Energy, & 
Environment 

Subject to Call 

 


